
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-1213

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Annual Contract for Severn Trent Multi-Point Gas Detector, Sensors &

TIME & Other Related Miscellaneous Supplies

DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 30, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

  UNIT

30 ea. PRICE 4,506.00 5,070.00

1. ADVANCE
tm 

Multipoint Gas Detector Series 1620B, Part #1620B-01-01-01-XX TOTAL 135,180.00 152,100.00 NO BID

 UNIT

30 ea. PRICE 529.00 699.00

2. Sensor Modules BM-5415 TOTAL 15,870.00 20,970.00 NO BID

 UNIT

30 ea. PRICE 389.00 438.00

3. Chlorine Sensor Element Chlorine (A-1387), Part #A-1387, 0-10 ppm TOTAL 11,670.00 13,140.00 NO BID

  *

  

 TOTAL TOTAL 162,720.00 186,210.00 NO BID

  

  

 Extension 1  162,720.00

 

  

 Extension 2  162,720.00

   

  

 Extension 3  162,720.00

Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Days 28-40 days 21-28 days

 
*LOW BIDDER 1

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Cemtrex, Inc. Demandstar

Macaulay Controls SAWS Website

MSC Industrial Supply
Severn Trent Services
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